NOTICE OF RECOMMENDATION FOR AWARD

Date of Issue: June 19, 2009

The Procurement Department hereby issues formal notice to respondents to Solicitation #0902190 for Medical

Laboratory Services that the following listed respondents will be recommended for award as indicated below.

The award action is anticipated to be executed by the Board of Supervisors on or after July 7, 2009.

Award is recommended to the Respondents submitting the low bids.

GROUP AWARDEE NAME (S)
Group A Sonora Qwest Laboratories
Blood Draw/Phlebotomy Service

Group B Center for Disease Detection
Diagnostic Tests

Group C Center for Disease Detection
Epidemiological Tests

Group D Center for Disease Detection
Pap Tests

Group E Center for Disease Detection
Sexually Transmitted Infection Tests

Group F Sonora Qwest L.aboratories

Therapeutic Drug Level Tests

GROUP OQTHER RESPONDENT FIRM NAMES
Group A Center for Disease Detection
Midwest Cancer Screening
Group B Sonocra Qwest Laboratories
Midwest Cancer Screening
Group C  Sonora Qwest Laboratories
Midwest Cancer Screening
Group D Midwest Cancer Screening
Sonora Qwest Laboratories
Group E  Midwest Cancer Screening
Sonora Qwest Laboratories
Group F  Center for Disease Detection

Midwest Cancer Screening

Issued by: Nina Schatz, Commodity/Contracts Officer

Telephone Number: 740-8719

BID OPENING
TABULATION AMOUNT
3 518.40

3 4,578.00
$ 797.00
$116,970.00
$247,850.00
$ 11,921.04

BID OPENING
TABULATION AMOUNT

No Bid
No Bid

$11,398.16
No Bid

$1,704.26
No Bid

$134,736.00
$310,575.90

$ 451,558.00
$1,281,034.95

No Bid
No Bid

This notice is in compliance with Pima County Procurement Code:

§11.12.010, §11.12.020, §11.20.010C

Copy to: Pima County MWBE (Fax 740-3646)

AWARD AMOUNT
$ 600.00

$ 4,600.00
$ 800.00
$117,000.00
$248,000.00

$ 12,000.00



